
Subject: FW: VLKB Booking Agent payment
From: "Muthukumar.i" <i.muthukumar@ponpurelogis�cs.com>
Date: 19-09-2022, 17:10
To: "'S..sridhar Suriyanarayanan'" <s.sridhar@ponpurelogis�cs.com>
CC: "'Aravindhan'" <aravindhan@ponpurelogis�cs.com>, "'vijay'" <podho@ponpurelogis�cs.com>,
"'THIRUPATHI'" <k.thirupathi@ponpurelogis�cs.com>

Dear sir,

Vellore Katpadi agent Security Deposit ( RS.5000) Received...

Attached file for your reference...

Regards
Muthukumar.i

-----Original Message-----
From: VijayAR [mailto:podho@ponpurelogistics.com] 
Sent: 19 September 2022 17:06
To: Muthukumar <i.muthukumar@ponpurelogistics.com>
Cc: S.Aravindhan Sreetharan <aravindhan@ponpurelogistics.com>; Thirupathi 
<k.thirupathi@ponpurelogistics.com>; Sridhar.S <s.sridhar@ponpurelogistics.com>
Subject: VLKB Booking Agent payment

Dear Sir,
                FYR..

Thanks,
Vijay AR
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A�achments:
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