
From : Somasundararaj.R <r.somasundararaj@ponpurelogistics.com>

Subject : RE: Ponpure Logistics-Debit-Details

To : 'Aravindhan' <aravindhan@ponpurelogistics.com>, 'Muthukumar.i' <i.muthukumar@ponpurelogistics.com>

Cc : 'Harish Ravi' <harish.r@ponpurelogistics.com>, 'Gunalan.G' <g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com>, 'Thirupathi.K' <k.thirupathi@ponpurelogistics.com>, 'BOOBALAN RAVIKUMAR' <customersupport@ponpurelogistics.com>

Zimbra accts.tryhub@ponpurelogistics.com

RE: Ponpure Logistics-Debit-Details

Fri, Dec 23, 2022 10:36 AM

 2 attachments

Dear Sir,

Consider the recoveries in installments.

From: Aravindhan [mailto:aravindhan@ponpurelogis�cs.com]

Sent: Friday, December 23, 2022 10:31 AM

To: 'Muthukumar.i'

Cc: 'Harish Ravi'; 'Gunalan.G'; 'Thirupathi.K'; 'BOOBALAN RAVIKUMAR'; 'Somasundararaj.R'

Subject: RE: Ponpure Logis�cs-Debit-Details

Adjust this as per the trail mail, wherever the labours are debited inform the cashier and deduct the same in next payments…

From: Somasundararaj.R [mailto:r.somasundararaj@ponpurelogistics.com]

Sent: 22 December 2022 18:35

To: 'BOOBALAN RAVIKUMAR' <customersupport@ponpurelogistics.com>

Cc: 'Harish Ravi' <harish.r@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Gunalan.G' <g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Aravindhan' <aravindhan@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Thirupathi.K' <k.thirupathi@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Muthukumar.i' <i.muthukumar@ponpurelogistics.com>

Subject: RE: Ponpure Logis�cs-Debit-Details

Dear Mr. Boopalan,

1. 05100332305930, Responsibility on delivery agent/HUB.
2. 05100332305564, Responsibility on delivery agent.
3. 05122332300903, Responsibility on delivery agent.
4. 05122332300961, Responsibility on delivery agent.
5. 05100332305663, Responsibility on Trichy HUB.
6. Rest all approved.

Thanks & Regards
R. Somasundararaj – DGM (Opera�ons)
Pon Pure Logis�cs Private Limited

No.1420, 13th Main Road, Anna Nagar, Chennai - 600 040 |Tamil Nadu, India.
Landline : +91 44 49021400-13 | Hand Phone : 9384821211

From: BOOBALAN RAVIKUMAR [mailto:customersupport@ponpurelogistics.com]

Sent: Thursday, December 22, 2022 3:54 PM

To: 'Somasundararaj.R'

Cc: 'Harish Ravi'; 'Gunalan.G'; 'Aravindhan'; 'Thirupathi.K'; 'Muthukumar.i'

Subject: RE: Ponpure Logis�cs-Debit-Details

Dear Sir,,

Out of 20 cases, below a�ached RM Fixa�on / Remarks for 13 cases.
Please approve to process.

S
N
o.

Way
bill
No.

Wa
ybill
Dat
e

Booki
ng
Branc
h

To
Branc
h Consignee

No
of
Ar�
cles

Invoice
No

H&S
Deb
it
valu
e

Wayb
ill_St
atus

R
E
M
A
R
K
S

DGM Advise on
12-Dec-2022 RM Remarks

1

0511
5732
3003
79

28-
04-
202

2

MADU
RAI KK
NAGA
R

PARA
MATH
I
VELU
R

KUMARAN
AGENCIES 7

334102
5275

116
32

POD
Verifi
ed

O
IL
D
A
M
A
G
E
IS
S
U
E-
M
O
V
E
D
T
O
U
P
D

CAN BE
ABSORBED BY
US

CAN BE ABSORBED
BY US

2

0200
4532
3007
76

01-
09-
202

2

GUM
MIDIP
OOND
I

AMB
UR

SATHYA
AGENCIES
PVT LTD 3

334702
5531

460
6

POD
Verifi
ed

A
B
R
FI
X
E
D

FIXATION
ALREADY SENT
TO ACCTS DEPT

FIXATION ALREADY
SENT TO ACCTS
DEPT

3

0510
0332
3059
30

16-
09-
202

2

MADU
RAI
HUB

TRICH
Y HUB

MALLIKA
FURNITURE
AND
ELECTRONICS
LLP, 3

334102
8275

334
4

POD
Verifi
ed

B
L
O
O
M
T
T
W
G
2.
0
LT
R
S
N
O
T
R
E
C
EI
V
E
D
/
P
O
D
V
E
RI
FI
E
D
A
T
T
RI
C
H
Y
H
U
B

Fixa�on to be
obtained from
RM

Delivered �me No
Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty
Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not
Response Our
Side. Don’t Accept
Debit

4

0510
0332
3055
64

08-
09-
202

2

MADU
RAI
HUB

MAD
URAI
SELLU
R

SATHYA
AGENCIES 3

334102
7984

186
6

Ready
For
Deliv
ery

R
F
D
A
T
M
D
SL

MDSL - Fixa�on
to be obtained
from RM

Delivered to
Madurai
Customer . Video
footage already
Shared to Delivery
Agent
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6

0512
2332
3006
78

30-
09-
202

2

MADU
RAI
SELLU
R

PERA
MBAL
UR

VASANTH
AND CO PBLR 1

334102
8827

430
0

Short
age

B
O
T
H
I
N
W
A
R
D
&
O
U
T
W
A
R
D
S
C
A
N
A
T
M
D
U
/
B
U
T
S
H
O
R
T
T
O
O
K
A
T
P
B
L
R
-
ID
LI
C
O
O
K
E
R
B
L
U
E
LI
N
E
6
P
L
A
T
E
S/
B
A
R
C
O
D
E
Sc
a
n
n
e
d
in
w
ar
d
o
ut
w
ar
d
/
b
ut
st
a
p
pl
e
d
th
e
s
�
ck
er
al
o
n
g
w
it
h
G
C
N
c
o
p
y/
M
is
si
n
g
it
e
m
is
ID
LY
C
o
o
k
er
/v
al
u
e
R
s.
4
3
0
0
/-

50% MDU &
50% ON PBLR /
Fixa�on to be
obtained from
RM

PERAMBALUR +
Madurai Hub
50%(Mani,Karuppus
amy,Muthupandi,R
anjith,Sathish,Abi,Si
vasankaran

8

0512
2332
3009
03

12-
10-
202

2

MADU
RAI
SELLU
R

PERA
MBAL
UR

VASANTH
AND CO 2

334102
9111 999

POD
Verifi
ed

P
O
D
V
E
RI
FI
E
D
W
IT
H
R

PBLR - Fixa�on
to be obtained
from RM

Delivered �me No
Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty
Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not
Response Our
Side. Don’t Accept
Debit
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E
M
A
R
KS
-
P
R
O
M
O
3L
T
R
S

9

0512
2332
3009
61

13-
10-
202

2

MADU
RAI
SELLU
R

NAGA
PATTI
NAM

GRIAS
INVESTMENT
P LTD 6

334102
9148

366
5

POD
Verifi
ed

N
O
S
C
A
N
/
N
O
S
H
O
R
T
A
G
E
C
O
M
P
L
AI
N
T
A
T
K
R
K
L

KRKL - Fixa�on
to be obtained
from RM

Delivered �me No
Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty
Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not
Response Our
Side. Don’t Accept
Debit

1
0

0512
2332
3009
54

13-
10-
202

2

MADU
RAI
SELLU
R

THAN
JAVU
R

MALLIKA
FURNITURE
AND
ELECTRONICS
LLP, 6

334102
9123,3
341029
125

456
1

Short
age

o
n
e
of
th
e
ar
�
cl
es
lo
a
d
e
d
th
ro
u
g
h
0
9
5
9
(t
vr
-
at
gi
.
m
q
d.
pt
k,
tv
r)
v
e
hi
cl
e
b
y
o
ur
st
a
ff
M
r.
K
ar
th
ik

KARTHIK,TVR,M
QD,PDKT -
Fixa�on to be
obtained from
RM

Silambarasan ,
TVR ,MQD , PDKT
& 0959 Vehicle
Vendor

1
1

0512
2332
3010
93

19-
10-
202

2

MADU
RAI
SELLU
R

MAN
NARG
UDI

MALLIKA
FURNITURE
AND
ELECTRONICS
LLP, 1

334102
9366

104
54

Short
age

B
O
O
KI
N
G
A
G
E
N
T

MDSL - Fixa�on
to be obtained
from RM MADURAI SELLUR

1
2

0200
4532
3017
32

30-
09-
202

2

GUM
MIDIP
OOND
I

SALE
M
HUB

VASANTH &
CO 4

334702
9060

107
5

POD
Verifi
ed

1
B
O
X
S
H
O
R
T-
SL
M
H
B

8 loadmens +
Krishnan night
shi� & Karthik
day shi�

8 loadmens +
Krishnan night shi�
& Karthik day shi�

1
3

0510
0332
3056
63

11-
09-
202

2

MADU
RAI
HUB

PATT
UKKO
TTAI

SATHYA
AGENCIES -
PATTUKOTTAI 5

334102
8096

225
9

POD
Verifi
ed

I
N
N
E
R
S
H
O
R
T
-

MDHB
Collec�ve -
Fixa�on to be
obtained from
RM

Delivered �me No
Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty
Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not
Response Our
Side. Don’t Accept
Debit

1
5

0200
4532
3003
64

09-
08-
202

2

GUM
MIDIP
OOND
I

SALE
M
HUB

SATHYA
AGENCIES
PVT LTD 7

334702
3687/3
347023
658

469
92

POD
Verifi
ed

1
O
N
LY
R
E
T

8 loadmens +
Krishnan night
shi� & Karthik
day shi�

8 loadmens +
Krishnan night shi�
& Karthik day shi�
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U
R
N
E
D
W
IT
H
C
O
N
SI
G
N
O
R-
SL
M
H
B
R
ES
P
O
N
SI
BL
E

1
6

0200
4532
3020
97

11-
10-
202

2

GUM
MIDIP
OOND
I

SALE
M
HUB

DARLING
DIGITAL
WORLD
PRIVATE
LIMITED 6

334702
9866

299
7

POD
Verifi
ed

4
O
N
LY
R
E
T
U
R
N
E
D
W
IT
H
C
O
N
SI
G
N
O
R-
SL
M
H
B
R
E
S
P
O
N
SI
B
L
E

8 loadmens +
Krishnan night
shi� & Karthik
day shi�

8 loadmens +
Krishnan night shi�
& Karthik day shi�

From: Gunalan G [mailto:g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com]

Sent: 15 December 2022 19:22

To: 'BOOBALAN RAVIKUMAR' <customersupport@ponpurelogistics.com>

Cc: 'Somasundararaj' <r.somasundararaj@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Aravindhan' <aravindhan@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'K.THIRUPATHI' <k.thirupathi@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'i.muthukumar' <i.muthukumar@ponpurelogistics.com>

Subject: RE: Ponpure Logis�cs-Debit-Details

Importance: High

Dear Sir,

Refer Below Fixa�on,

Waybill No.
Waybill
Date

Booking
Branch

To Branch Consignee
No of
Ar�cles

Invoice No
H&S
Debit
value

Waybill_Status REMARKS Remarks

5100332305930
16-09-202

2
MADURAI
HUB

TRICHY HUB
MALLIKA FURNITURE AND
ELECTRONICS LLP,

3 3341028275 3344 POD Verified BLOOM TTWG 2.0 LTRS NOT RECEIVED/POD VERIFIED AT TRICHY HUB

Delivered �me No Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not Response Our Side.
Don’t Accept Debit

5100332305564
08-09-202

2
MADURAI
HUB

MADURAI SELLUR SATHYA AGENCIES 3 3341027984 1866
Ready For
Delivery

RFD AT MDSL

Delivered to Madurai Customer .
Video footage already Shared to
Delivery Agent

5122332300678
30-09-202

2
MADURAI
SELLUR

PERAMBALUR VASANTH AND CO PBLR 1 3341028827 4300 Shortage

BOTH INWARD & OUTWARD SCAN AT MDU/BUT SHORT TOOK AT
PBLR - IDLI COOKER BLUE LINE 6 PLATES/BARCODE Scanned inward
outward /but stappled the s�cker along with GCN copy/ Missing item
is IDLY Cooker/value Rs.4300/-

PERAMBALUR + Madurai Hub
50%(Mani,Karuppusamy,Muthupandi,Ran
jith,Sathish,Abi,Sivasankaran)

5122332300903
12-10-202

2
MADURAI
SELLUR

PERAMBALUR VASANTH AND CO 2 3341029111 999 POD Verified POD VERIFIED WITH REMARKS - PROMO 3LTRS

Delivered �me No Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not Response Our Side.
Don’t Accept Debit

5122332300961
13-10-202

2
MADURAI
SELLUR

NAGAPATTINAM GRIAS INVESTMENT P LTD 6 3341029148 3665 POD Verified NO SCAN/NO SHORTAGE COMPLAINT AT KRKL

Delivered �me No Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not Response Our Side.
Don’t Accept Debit

5122332300954
13-10-202

2
MADURAI
SELLUR

THANJAVUR
MALLIKA FURNITURE AND
ELECTRONICS LLP,

6 ################### 4561 Shortage
one of the ar�cles loaded through 0959 (tvr-atgi.mqd.ptk,tvr)vehicle
by our staff Mr.Karthik

Silambarasan , TVR ,MQD , PDKT &
0959 Vehicle Vendor

5122332301093
19-10-202

2
MADURAI
SELLUR

MANNARGUDI
MALLIKA FURNITURE AND
ELECTRONICS LLP,

1 3341029366 10454 Shortage BOOKING AGENT MADURAI SELLUR

5100332305663
11-09-202

2
MADURAI
HUB

PATTUKKOTTAI
SATHYA AGENCIES -
PATTUKOTTAI

5 3341028096 2259 POD Verified INNER SHORT -

Delivered �me No Complaint. As per
Booking Quan�ty Delivered. Invoice
Ar�cle Short Not Response Our Side.
Don’t Accept Debit

Thanks & Regards
Gunalan G
Regional Manager – EAST
Villupuram/Trichy/Madurai/Tirunelveli
Pon Pure Logis�cs Private Limited

No.1420, 13th Main Road, Anna Nagar, Chennai - 600 040 |Tamil Nadu, India.
Landline : +91 44 49021400-13 | Hand Phone : 7823980476

From: BOOBALAN RAVIKUMAR [mailto:customersupport@ponpurelogistics.com]

Sent: 12 December 2022 19:44

To: 'Gunalan G'

Cc: 'Somasundararaj'; 'Aravindhan'; 'K.THIRUPATHI'; 'i.muthukumar'

Subject: FW: Ponpure Logis�cs-Debit-Details

Dear Sir,

Please fix the responsibility as per the trail mail.

Zimbra https://mail.ponpurelogistics.com/h/printmessage?id=29076&part=2&t...
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Waybill No. Waybill Date Booking Branch To Branch Consignee No of Ar�cles Invoice No
H&S Debit
value Waybill_Status REMARKS DGM Advise on 12-Dec-2022

05100332305930 16-09-2022 MADURAI HUB TRICHY HUB MALLIKA FURNITURE AND ELECTRONICS LLP, 3 3341028275 3344 POD Verified

BLOOM TTWG 2.0
LTRS NOT
RECEIVED/POD
VERIFIED AT TRICHY
HUB Fixa�on to be obtained from RM

05100332305564 08-09-2022 MADURAI HUB MADURAI SELLUR SATHYA AGENCIES 3 3341027984 1866 Ready For Delivery RFD AT MDSL MDSL - Fixa�on to be obtained from RM

05122332300678 30-09-2022 MADURAI SELLUR PERAMBALUR VASANTH AND CO PBLR 1 3341028827 4300 Shortage

BOTH INWARD &
OUTWARD SCAN AT
MDU/BUT SHORT
TOOK AT PBLR - IDLI
COOKER BLUE LINE 6
PLATES/BARCODE
Scanned inward
outward /but
stappled the s�cker
along with GCN copy/
Missing item is IDLY
Cooker/value
Rs.4300/-

50% MDU & 50% ON PBLR /
Fixa�on to be obtained from RM

05122332300903 12-10-2022 MADURAI SELLUR PERAMBALUR VASANTH AND CO 2 3341029111 999 POD Verified

POD VERIFIED WITH
REMARKS - PROMO
3LTRS PBLR - Fixa�on to be obtained from RM

05122332300961 13-10-2022 MADURAI SELLUR NAGAPATTINAM GRIAS INVESTMENT P LTD 6 3341029148 3665 POD Verified

NO SCAN/NO
SHORTAGE
COMPLAINT AT KRKL KRKL - Fixa�on to be obtained from RM

05122332300954 13-10-2022 MADURAI SELLUR THANJAVUR MALLIKA FURNITURE AND ELECTRONICS LLP, 6 3341029123,3341029125 4561 Shortage

one of the ar�cles
loaded through 0959
(tvr-
atgi.mqd.ptk,tvr)vehi
cle by our staff
Mr.Karthik

KARTHIK,TVR,MQD,PDKT - Fixa�on to be obtained
from RM

05122332301093 19-10-2022 MADURAI SELLUR MANNARGUDI MALLIKA FURNITURE AND ELECTRONICS LLP, 1 3341029366 10454 Shortage BOOKING AGENT MDSL - Fixa�on to be obtained from RM

05100332305663 11-09-2022 MADURAI HUB PATTUKKOTTAI SATHYA AGENCIES - PATTUKOTTAI 5 3341028096 2259 POD Verified INNER SHORT - MDHB Collec�ve - Fixa�on to be obtained from RM

Regards

Boobalan. R

From: Somasundararaj.R [mailto:r.somasundararaj@ponpurelogistics.com]

Sent: 25 November 2022 11:37

To: 'BOOBALAN RAVIKUMAR' <customersupport@ponpurelogistics.com>

Cc: 'Aravindhan' <aravindhan@ponpurelogistics.com>

Subject: FW: Ponpure Logis�cs-Debit-Details

From: Venkatesh D (Freight) [mailto:venkatesh.dhandapani@hssupplychain.com]

Sent: Friday, November 25, 2022 10:55 AM

To: Somasundararaj R; S.Aravindhan Sreetharan; Thirupathi K; Anandhakumar Nagarajan; customersupport; Selva Kumar - Madurai; Gummidipoondi Agent

Cc: Gopu Arunachalam; Dhanasekar N; Dhanasekar N; Madurai WH

Subject: Fwd: Ponpure Logis�cs-Debit-Details

HI Team

Please note debit details.

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Silambarasan R (F&A) <silambarasan.r@hssupplychain.com>
Date: Fri, Nov 25, 2022 at 10:48 AM
Subject: Ponpure Logistics-Debit-Details
To: Venkatesh D (Freight) <venkatesh.dhandapani@hssupplychain.com>
Cc: Devarasan SM <Devarasan.SM@hssupplychain.com>, Dinesh Kumar Vendor Help Desk <dinesh.kumar@hssupplychain.com>

Dear Venkatesh
 As per your request, Herewith I am attached debit note details for your reference.

Zimbra https://mail.ponpurelogistics.com/h/printmessage?id=29076&part=2&t...
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