S.Suresh Babu

From: S.Suresh Babu <s.sureshbabu@ponpurelogistics.com>

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 1:18 PM

To: ‘KS Varadarajan'; 'Subash C'; 'HIL Chennai Customer Support’

Cc: ‘Karuppasamy R'; 'Bibin Xavier'; 'baby electronics’; ‘R.Thanraj’; ‘llayaraja K'; ‘Chandrasekaran Pr'; ‘Devakar D'; ‘ChristopherKumar D’;
‘Gunalan.G'; ‘Shanmugapriya’; ‘Santhanakrishnan K'

Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Dear Sir

We have paid the invoice amount to consignee Baby Electronics as per the details below:

Amount : Rs. 3174.00
Date of transfer : 14-01-2020 at 17:22:01
UTR no RATNN20014340154

Kindly confirm the receipt of the amount.

Thanks & Regards
S. Suresh Babu

From: KS Varadarajan [mailto:KS.VARADARAJAN@HAVELLS.COM]

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 6:28 PM

To: Subash C <Subash.C@Havells.Com>; 'S.Suresh Babu' <s.sureshbabu@ponpurelogistics.com>

Cc: Karuppasamy R <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; Bibin Xavier <Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>; 'baby electronics' <babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-
hil.cbe@flyjac.com>; 'llayaraja K' <ilayaraja.cbe@flyjac.com>; Chandrasekaran Pr <chandrasekaran.pr@Illoydmail.com>; Devakar D <Devakar.D@havells.com>;
ChristopherKumar D <christopher.D@havells.com>; 'Gunalan.G' <g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Shanmugapriya' <coordchennai@ponpurelogistics.com>;
Santhanakrishnan K <Santhanakrishnan.K@havells.com>

Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Suresh Ji

Pls arrange to settle



Regards
Varadarajan KS
Ph 9952269797

From: Subash C

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 5:41 PM

To: 'S.Suresh Babu' <s.sureshbabu@ponpurelogistics.com>; KS Varadarajan <KS.VARADARAJAN@HAVELLS.COM>

Cc: Karuppasamy R <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; Bibin Xavier <Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>; 'baby electronics' <babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-
hil.cbe@flyjac.com>; 'llayaraja K' <ilayaraja.cbe@flyjac.com>; Chandrasekaran Pr <chandrasekaran.pr@Iloydmail.com>; Devakar D <Devakar.D@havells.com>;
ChristopherKumar D <christopher.D@havells.com>; 'Gunalan.G' <g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Shanmugapriya' <coordchennai@ponpurelogistics.com>;
Santhanakrishnan K <Santhanakrishnan.K@havells.com>

Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Dear Sir,
Pls update the consignment status

From: Devakar D [mailto:Devakar.D@havells.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2020 6:34 PM

To: 'S.Suresh Babu' <s.sureshbabu@ ponpurelogistics.com>; KS Varadarajan <KS.VARADARAJAN@HAVELLS.COM>

Cc: Karuppasamy R <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; Bibin Xavier <Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>; 'baby electronics' <babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-

hil.cbe @flyjac.com>; 'llayaraja K' <ilayaraja.cbe@flyjac.com>; Chandrasekaran Pr <chandrasekaran.pr@I|loydmail.com>; ChristopherKumar D <christopher.D@havells.com>;

'Gunalan.G' <g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Shanmugapriya' <coordchennai@ponpurelogistics.com>; Subash C <Subash.C@Havells.Com>; Santhanakrishnan K
<Santhanakrishnan.K@havells.com>
Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Dear sir,

Kindly update status .Most urgent .AS discussed with ASC materials not received still date. Kindly make to deliver today most urgent .
Regards
D.DEVAKAR

From: Subash C
Sent: 07 January 2020 18:27
To: 'S.Suresh Babu' <s.sureshbabu@ponpurelogistics.com>; KS Varadarajan <KS.VARADARAJAN@HAVELLS.COM>
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Cc: Devakar D <Devakar.D@havells.com>; Karuppasamy R <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; Bibin Xavier <Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>; 'baby electronics'
<babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-hil.che @flyjac.com>; 'llayaraja K' <ilayaraja.cbe @flyjac.com>; Chandrasekaran Pr <chandrasekaran.pr@I|loydmail.com>;
ChristopherKumar D <christopher.D@havells.com>; 'Gunalan.G' <g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com>; 'Shanmugapriya' <coordchennai@ponpurelogistics.com>

Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Dear Sir,
Still not delivery to customer Pls update the status material most urgent

From: S.Suresh Babu [mailto:s.sureshbabu@ponpurelogistics.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2020 1:45 PM

To: 'KS Varadarajan' <KS.VARADARAJAN@HAVELLS.COM>

Cc: 'Devakar D' <Devakar.D@havells.com>; '‘Karuppasamy R' <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; 'Subash C' <Subash.C@Havells.Com>; 'Bibin Xavier'
<Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>; 'baby electronics' <babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-hil.cbe @flyjac.com>; 'llayaraja K' <ilayaraja.cbe @flyjac.com>;
'Chandrasekaran Pr' <chandrasekaran.pr@Illoydmail.com>; 'ChristopherKumar D' <christopher.D@havells.com>; 'Gunalan.G' <g.gunalan@ponpurelogistics.com>;
'Shanmugapriya' <coordchennai@ponpurelogistics.com>

Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Dear Sir
Please give us time till 3 pm will check and revert.

Thanks & Regards
S. Suresh Babu

From: KS Varadarajan [mailto:KS.VARADARAJAN@HAVELLS.COM]

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2020 12:58 PM

To: 'S.Suresh Babu' <s.sureshbabu@ponpurelogistics.com>

Cc: Devakar D <Devakar.D@havells.com>; Karuppasamy R <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; Subash C <Subash.C@Havells.Com>; Bibin Xavier <Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>;
'baby electronics' <babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-hil.cbe @flyjac.com>; llayaraja K <ilayaraja.cbe @flyjac.com>; Chandrasekaran Pr
<chandrasekaran.pr@Illoydmail.com>; ChristopherKumar D <christopher.D@havells.com>

Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Suresh Ji

Pls confirm the status of Lr no 769814



Regards
Varadarajan KS
Ph 9952269797
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View Waybill Details

Waybill No | EC/CHHB/182481/19-20 Manual No | 769814 Origin | CHENNAI HUB

Destination | TUTICORIN Consignor | HAVELLS INDIA LIMITED Consignee | BABY ELECTRONICS
No.of Art | 1 Actual Wt(Kg) | 5.000 Basic Freight | 80.000

DC Charges | 0.000 DD Charges | 50.000 Total Freight | 130.000

Shipping Via | TN38AM3754 Status | Shortage Expected Delivery | 04-Jan-2020

@ @& @ v

Consignment Booked Shipped Consignment Arrived Delivered
CHENNAI HUB , 01-Jan-2020 6:03PM TUTICORIN , 04-]an-2020 6:49AM TUTICORIMN , 04-Jan-2020 8:14PM

Reason for not delivery

Customer Required
Reason Branch Remarks Vehicle In-Timing Date

No Data found

Invoice Details

No Of Time
Invoice Value Of E-Wayhbill E-Wayhbill E-Waybill Last Vehicle
Number Invoice Date Consignment E-Wayhill Status Validity Extend Part B Update on No

5667524989 | 01-J]an-2020 2688.000 531158111701 | Valid Ewaybill 08-J]an-2020 02-)an-2020 11:23PM TNO1BES805

5667524989 | 01-Jan-2020 2688.000 531158111701 | Valid Ewaybill 08-Jan-2020 04-]an-2020 6:49AM TN38AM3754

O Type here to search

From: ChristopherKumar D
Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2020 12:36 PM
To: KS Varadarajan <KS.VARADARAJAN@HAVELLS.COM>




Cc: Devakar D <Devakar.D@havells.com>; Karuppasamy R <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; Subash C <Subash.C@Havells.Com>; Bibin Xavier <Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>;
'baby electronics' <babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-hil.cbe @flyjac.com>; llayaraja K <ilayaraja.cbe @flyjac.com>; Chandrasekaran Pr
<chandrasekaran.pr@Illoydmail.com>

Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Dear Varadhu Sir,

Please update the status.

From: Subash C

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2020 11:54 AM

To: Bibin Xavier <Bibin.Xavier@havells.com>

Cc: Devakar D <Devakar.D@havells.com>; Karuppasamy R <Karuppasamy.R@havells.com>; 'baby electronics' <babyestuty@gmail.com>; 'R.Thanraj' <dispatch-

hil.cbe @flyjac.com>; llayaraja K <ilayaraja.cbe @flyjac.com>; ChristopherKumar D <christopher.D@havells.com>; Chandrasekaran Pr <chandrasekaran.pr@I|loydmail.com>
Subject: RE: Material Not Received - Baby electronics

Dear Bibin,
The below consignment till not delivery to service center Pls update the status

@; ﬁﬁccounting BiIIing documents | &1

'_N Exc Depot Ret Samp « | 5667524929/ Met Value | 2,688.00 |INR |

_Payer |FcBR2140 | Baby Electronics / 8/4-Jeyraj Road / 628003 Tuticorin

Biling Date [31.12.2013]

B Item | Description Billed Quantity SU Met value Material Cost
10  JETAQUANTOFLSS0WLED7655YMPC 1.000NOS 1,906.60 LHEFACUTEZTJ050  566.47 -
30 CO SP-MAIN MOTOR WITH MOUNT PLATE BRINA 1.000NOS 781.40 GSCCUYMIMOOE 556. 61 e

From: baby electronics [mailto:babyestuty@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 7, 2020 10:59 AM

To: Subash C <subash.c@havells.com>; Devakar D <Devakar.D@havells.com>; Karuppasamy.r@havells.com
Subject: Material Not Received

Dear Sir,



Invoice No : - 5667524989
Date : 31/12/2019

Materials are not received please check the parcel details
Thank you

By
Baby Electronics



