RE: Vasanth and co Aminjikarai - Accept the material
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		to Coimbatore, Warehouse, K, Vimalkumar, Pradeep, VINOTH, ec.cben, ec.cbe, Manikandan.M, me, r, customersupport, Pon
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Dear Sir,
 
Awaiting for your response, please approve for send back to Vasanth and co Aminjikarai
 
Thanks
Shanmugapriya B
 
From: Shanmugapriya B [mailto:coordchennai@ponpurelogistics.com]
Sent: 21 May 2022 15:57
To: Coimbatore 1 (coimbatore.cfa@bajajelectricals.com); Warehouse In Charge Coimbatore (Naisal M) (naisal.m@bajajelectricals.com); K JINSHAD (K.JINSHAD@mahindra.com); 'Vimalkumar K'; 'Pradeep M'
Cc: ec.cben@ponpurelogistics.com; 'ec.cbe@ponpurelogistics.com' (ec.cbe@ponpurelogistics.com); Manikandan.M (manikandan.m@ponpurelogistics.com); ppecben@gmail.com; 'r somasundararaj' (r.somasundararaj@ponpurelogistics.com); 'customersupport'; Pon Pure Expres (expres@ponpurelogistics.com)
Subject: RE: Vasanth and co Aminjikarai - Accept the material
 
Dear Sir,
 
Awaiting for your response.
 
Thanks
Shanmugapriya B
 
From: Shanmugapriya B [mailto:coordchennai@ponpurelogistics.com]
Sent: 12 May 2022 12:26
To: Coimbatore 1 (coimbatore.cfa@bajajelectricals.com); Warehouse In Charge Coimbatore (Naisal M) (naisal.m@bajajelectricals.com); K JINSHAD (K.JINSHAD@mahindra.com); 'Vimalkumar K'; 'Pradeep M'
Cc: ec.cben@ponpurelogistics.com; 'ec.cbe@ponpurelogistics.com' (ec.cbe@ponpurelogistics.com); Manikandan.M (manikandan.m@ponpurelogistics.com); ppecben@gmail.com; 'r somasundararaj' (r.somasundararaj@ponpurelogistics.com); 'customersupport'; Pon Pure Expres (expres@ponpurelogistics.com)
Subject: Vasanth and co Aminjikarai - Accept the material
 
Dear Sir,
 
As per Mr. Suresh instruction we collect the below mentioned consignment from Vasanth and co 5 no of article. But Mahindra warehouse not accept the material due to invoice wrong, here I enclosed the invoice copy for your reference. Many times we attempted delivery due to this our agent facing trouble. So please instruct them to accept this material or else please approve to return it to Vasanth and co  
 
	Waybill No.
	Waybill Date
	Bill Type
	Booking Branch
	To Branch
	Customer
	Consignee
	No of Articles
	OLD Invoice No

	02004732200108
	24-01-2022
	Credit
	CHENNAI PERIAMET
	COIMBATORE NORTH
	VASANTH & CO [PW]
	MAHINDRA LOGISTICS LTD (CFA FO - COIMBATORE
	5
	1121


 
 
 
 
With Warm Regards
SHANMUGAPRIYA B
Assistant Manager - Coordination
9150112229 / 7823980452
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		to Shanmugapriya, Coimbatore, K, Vimalkumar, Pradeep, VINOTH, ec.cben@ponpurelogistics.com, ec.cbe@ponpurelogistics.com, Manikandan.M, me, r, customersupport, Pon
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Please send it back to warehouse.. Not vasant..
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